
Bid Summary
Bid #2285: 2026 Staff and Participant Apparel

Bid Submission Deadline: October 30, 2025 at 2pm
Bid Opening: Immediately Following

Bidder
Category A:        

Aquatics Staff Apparel
Category B:              

Hats and Lanyards

Category C:            
Summer Camp 

Apparel -                   
Staff & Participant

Category D:       
Program Apparel - 
Staff & Participant

Category E:                 
Outdoor Youth Soccer 

Uniforms

Category F:          
Division Staff Apparel               

Absolutely Creative Promotions
185 East Marion Avenue $6,772.95 $7,052.87 $17,326.50 $68,750.50 $169,427.20 No Bid

Lake Forest, Illinois 60045
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc.

8120 Westglen Drive $4,235.29 $5,171.42 $8,480.29 $33,031.29 $54,317.60 $10,940.31
Houston, Texas 77063

All-Star Elite Sports
1871 North Gaffey Street, Suite C $5,783.98 No Bid $12,411.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid

San Pedro, California 90731
Arena Sports USA

820 Black Partridge Road Did not Bid No Bid No Bid Incomplete Bid $79,302.23 No Bid
McHenry, Illinois 60051
Challenger Teamwear

117 Emerald Drive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58,308.00 No Bid
Napervillle, Illinois 60540

JBC Threadworks LLC
60W 110N $5,644.13 $5,399.61 $12,850.41 $42,239.69 $151,032.80 $15,337.90

Richfield, Utah 84701
ParkInk

7040 Ave. Encinas #104 $5,976.60 $5,746.50 $14,610.50 $60,013.25 $89,440.00 $12,269.71
Carlsbad, California 92011
The Woolenwear Company

739 Pinecrest Drive $4,976.42 $5,163.75 $11,096.50 $51,811.75 $106,124.00 $15,523.70
Prospect Heights, Illinois 60070
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