



## Bid Summary

### Bid #2174: 2020 Staff and Participant Apparel

Bid Submission Deadline: December 4, 2019 @ 1pm

Bid Opening: December 4, 2019 @ 1:15pm

Bidder	Category A: Embroidered Apparel	Category B: Hats, Bags & Lanyards	Category C: Jerseys	Category D: Lacrosse Jerseys	Category E: Screened Apparel	Category F: Soccer Uniforms
Arena Sports USA, Inc. 820 Black Partridge Rd. McHenry, IL 60051	\$1,513.65	\$6,467.50	\$9,325.86	\$6,904.00	\$30,867.38	\$22,905.00
BSN Sports P.O. Box 7726 Dallas, TX 75209	Non-Conforming Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	\$2,786.00	Non-Conforming Bid	\$24,128.20
Kiddles, Inc. 258 Market Square Lake Forest, IL 60045	No Bid	No Bid	\$18,247.25	\$3,206.50	No Bid	\$27,546.80
Score Sports 726 Anaheim Street Wilmington, CA 90744	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22,396.00
World of Promotions 1310 Louis Ave. Elk Grove Village, IL 60007	\$1,554.90	\$6,946.25	\$17,469.74	\$3,209.80	\$29,084.36	\$33,845.60