



Bid Summary

Bid #2160: 2019 Staff and Participant Apparel

Bid Submission Deadline: November 28, 2018 @ 1pm

Bid Opening: November 28, 2018 @ 1:15pm

Bidder	Category A: Aquatic Staff Apparel	Category B: Basketball Jerseys	Category C: Embroidered Staff Apparel	Category D: Flag Football Jerseys	Category E: Hats, Bags & Lanyards	Category F: Hockey Training Academy Jerseys	Category G: Program Apparel - Staff & Participant	Category H: Summer Camp Apparel - Staff & Participant	Category I: Women's Mixer Hockey League Jerseys
Added Incentives, Inc. 618 Academy Dr., Suite A Northbrook, IL 60062	\$2,286.15	No Bid	\$925.00	No Bid	\$6,513.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Arena Sports USA, Inc. 820 Black Partridge Rd. McHenry, IL 60051	\$2,447.80	\$4,234.29	\$1,249.50	\$819.00	\$6,469.35	\$692.93	\$12,437.29	\$6,512.75	\$1,042.84
Axio Soccer 1200 Wheeling Rd. Wheeling, IL 60090	No Bid	\$10,093.00	No Bid	No Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BSN Sports, LLC PO Box 7726 Dallas, TX 75209	\$3,331.50	\$10,828.29	\$1,292.25	\$1,387.80	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid	\$18,156.61	\$9,746.86	No Bid
EPI 1342 North IH 35 East Carrollton, TX 75006	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid
Express Press 1860 E. St. Louis Street Springfield, MO 65802	\$2,467.65	\$5,665.91	\$964.50	\$960.00	\$7,398.98	No Bid	\$12,902.77	\$6,434.24	No Bid
Fantastic Lettering 5644 Lawrence Ave. Chicago, IL 60630	\$2,896.25	No Bid	\$1,150.00	No Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	\$1,078.00	\$15,434.50	\$7,944.25	No Bid
Sharp Sports 403 Earl Rd. Shorewood, IL 60404	\$2,349.11	\$3,621.99	\$1,029.50	\$863.10	No Bid	\$701.60	No Bid	\$7,071.97	\$1,385.01