



## Bid Summary

### Bid #2142: Hard Court Repairs

Bid Submission Deadline: December 12, 2017 @ 1:15pm

Bid Opening: December 12, 2017 @ 1:30pm

Bidder	Item #1: Meadowhill Hockey Rink	Item #2: Crestwood Park Tennis Court	Item #3: Oaklane Park Tennis Court	Item #4: Stonegate Park Tennis Court	Item #5: Floral Park Basketball Court	TOTAL BASE BID - ALL SITES COMBINED
10-S Court Solutions 736 N. Western Ave. Lake Forest, IL 60045	\$10,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$13,500.00	\$3,500.00	\$50,000.00
U.S. Tennis Court Construction Co. 204 Industrial Dr. Lockport, IL 60441	\$10,800.00	\$3,700.00	\$27,750.00	\$15,600.00	\$3,000.00	\$60,850.00
First Impression, Inc. 1951 N. Rose St. (25th Ave.) Franklin Park, IL 60131	\$15,400.00	\$1,400.00	\$28,200.00	\$15,140.00	\$2,400.00	\$62,540.00

Bidder	Alternate #1: Chisel, Prime, Patch & Paint All Footers Along South Elevation	Alternate #2: Remove & Reset All Fence Posts Along South Elevation	Alternate #3: Meadowhill Hockey Rink Color Coating - SkateMaster Coating	Alternate #4: Oaklane Park Asphalt Repair
10-S Court Solutions 736 N. Western Ave. Lake Forest, IL 60045	\$10,000.00	\$8,400.00	\$20,000.00	\$5,000.00
U.S. Tennis Court Construction Co. 204 Industrial Dr. Lockport, IL 60441	\$3,200.00	\$6,500.00	\$16,500.00	\$4,000.00
First Impression, Inc. 1951 N. Rose St. (25th Ave.) Franklin Park, IL 60131	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid