



Bid Summary
Bid #2138: 2018 Staff and Participant Apparel

Bid Submission Deadline: November 29, 2017 @ 1pm

Bid Opening: November 29, 2017 @ 1:15pm

Bidder	Category A: Aquatic Staff Apparel	Category B: Basketball Jerseys	Category C: Embroidered Staff Apparel	Category D: Flag Football Jerseys	Category E: Hats, Bags & Lanyards	Category F: Hockey Training Academy Jerseys	Category G: Program Apparel - Staff & Participant	Category H: Soccer Uniforms	Category I: Summer Camp Apparel - Staff & Participant	Category J: Women's Mixer Hockey League Jerseys
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas 8120 Westglen Houston, TX 77063	\$1,841.38	\$9,172.40	\$1,492.95	\$895.30	\$4,382.95	\$925.60	\$10,280.56	\$17,564.64	\$5,677.54	\$1,470.23
Added Incentives, Inc. 618 Academy Drive, Ste. A Northbrook, IL 60062	\$2,572.02	\$10,018.80	\$1,356.32	No Bid	\$5,154.42	No Bid	\$14,355.31	\$34,423.36	\$11,223.00	No Bid
Arena Sports USA 300 Jandus Rd., Ste. 103 Cary, IL 60013	\$1,959.40	\$7,130.00	\$1,600.00	\$700.00	\$5,657.42	\$640.00	\$11,858.70	\$18,428.00	\$5,860.75	\$792.00
Challenger Sports 8263 Flint St. Lenexa, KS 66214	No Bid	\$10,110.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$19,482.72	No Bid	No Bid
Score Sports 726 E. Anaheim St. Wilmington, CA 90744	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sharp Sports 403 Earl Rd. Shorewood, IL 60404	\$2,223.66	\$7,298.80	\$1,244.01	\$777.00	\$5,941.62	\$722.00	\$12,186.82	\$21,145.12	\$6,705.44	\$1,335.21
Sunburst Sportswear, Inc. 95 N. Brandon Dr. Glendale Heights, IL 60139	\$1,999.46	\$11,453.20	\$1,332.30	\$677.88	\$5,728.78	\$699.60	\$11,622.36	No Bid	\$6,375.48	\$1,190.02
Work N Turn 300 Knightsbridge Pkwy #160 Lincolnshire, IL 60069	\$3,599.28	\$11,187.20	No Bid	\$1,376.90	\$8,787.55	\$845.60	\$19,488.89	\$62,338.40	\$12,117.10	\$1,970.26
YBA Shirts 1184 N. Industrial Park Rd. Orem, UT 84057	No Bid	\$7,645.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23,532.00	No Bid	No Bid