

**Bid #2090: 2016 Staff Participant Apparel
Bid Summary**

	Category A: Aquatic Staff Apparel	Category B: Basketball Jerseys	Category C: Flag Football Jerseys	Category D: Hats, Bags & Lanyards	Category E: Hockey Training Academy Jerseys	Category F: Program Apparel - Staff & Participant	Category G: Soccer Uniforms - 2016-2018	Category H: Summer Camp Apparel - Staff & Participant	Category I: Women's Mixer Hockey League Jerseys
3E Prints 1510 Hubbard Ave. Batavia, IL 60510	\$3,080.89	\$19,489.80	\$3,761.04	No Bid	No Bid	\$13,713.24	\$76,947.20	\$13,961.47	\$962.50
Challenger Teamwear 1665 Quincy Ave. Ste. 111 Naperville, IL 60540	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$33,701.40	No Bid	No Bid
Koppel Advertising 702 Broadway Ave. Bedford, OH 44146	\$2,483.00	\$12,183.00	\$3,250.80	\$10,994.11	No Bid	\$10,741.80	\$40,128.84	\$9,777.12	No Bid
M & M Sports Scene 1010 W. Fullerton Ave. Addison, IL 60101	\$3,519.62	\$23,941.40	\$5,796.00	\$13,520.03	No Bid	\$15,555.41	No Bid	\$14,912.31	\$937.65
Professional Vision Design (PVD) Promo 500 W. Algonquin Rd. Ste. B Mount Prospect, IL 60056	\$2,162.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Roselynn Fashions Ltd. 900 Elizabeth St. Elgin, IL 60120	\$2,458.00	\$8,575.00	\$2,898.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,986.20	No Bid	\$7,896.35	No Bid
Score Sports 726 E. Anaheim St. Wilmington, CA 90744	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$31,710.60	No Bid	No Bid
Sunburst Sportswear 95 N. Brandon Dr. Glendale Heights, IL 60139	\$2,179.60	\$10,960.40	\$2,978.64	\$11,144.44	\$1,812.24	\$9,488.02	No Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid
Varcity Apparel LLC. 2012 Corporate Ln., Suite 128 Naperville, IL 60563	\$2,473.98	\$13,955.20	\$3,311.28	\$11,158.18	\$1,005.48	\$11,434.49	\$68,739.48	\$12,589.69	\$627.90
YBA Shirts 1184 North Industrial Park Rd. Orem, UT 84057	No Bid	\$8,516.20	\$3,142.44	Non-Conforming Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

