



## Bid Summary

### Bid #2126: Northbrook Sports Center Boiler Replacement

Bid Submission Deadline: May 24, 2017 @ 1pm

Bid Opening: May 24, 2017 @ 1:15pm

Bidder	Total Base Bid	Total Alternate #1	Total Alternate #2
AMS Mechanical Systems, Inc. 9341 Adam Don Pkwy Woodridge, IL 60517	\$141,667.00	\$139,900.00	\$119,900.00
Jensen's Plumbing & Heating, Inc. 670 E. Calhoun St. Woodstock, IL 60098	\$158,886.00	\$157,920.00	\$160,724.00
F.E. Moran, Inc. 2265 Carlson Dr. Northbrook, IL 60062	\$171,600.00	No Bid	\$166,600.00
Amber Mechanical Contractors, Inc. 11950 S. Central Ave. Alsip, IL 60803	\$172,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Air Con Refrigeration & Heating, Inc. 123 Lake St. Waukegan, IL 60085	\$175,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Pro Temp of Illinois, Inc. 101 Stirrup Ln. Burr Ridge, IL 60527	\$185,600.00	\$180,500.00	\$185,500.00
McDonough Mechanical Services, Inc. 4081 Joseph Dr. Waukegan, IL 60087	\$194,070.00	\$195,380.00	\$212,940.00