



Bid Summary

Bid #2120: 2017 Staff and Participant Apparel

Bid Submission Deadline: January 18, 2017 @ 1pm

Bid Opening: December 18, 2017 @ 1:15pm

Bidder	Category A: Aquatic Staff Apparel	Category B: Basketball Jerseys	Category C: Flag Football Jerseys	Category D: Hats, Bags & Lanyards	Category E: Hockey Training Academy Jerseys	Category F: Program Apparel - Staff & Participant	Category G: Women's Mixer Hockey League Jerseys	Category H: Summer Camp Apparel - Staff & Participant
Arena Sports USA 300 Jandos Road, Suite 103 Cary, IL 60013	\$2,203.10	\$7,480.00	\$2,526.28	\$6,426.42	\$960.00	\$11,170.15	\$560.00	\$7,124.75
Express Press 1860 E. St. Louis Street Springfield, MO 65802	\$2,461.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$13,759.52	No Bid	\$9,710.48
PGS Custom Products 550 Pratt Avenue N. Schaumburg, IL 60193	\$3,081.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16,289.90	No Bid	\$10,802.70
Roselynn Fashions Ltd. 900 Elizabeth Street Elgin, IL 60120	\$2,096.40	\$7,260.00	\$2,961.00	No Bid	\$1,194.00	\$11,223.65	No Bid	No Bid
Sharp Sports 403 Earl Road Shorewood, IL 60404	\$2,559.53	\$6,682.30	\$2,567.70	\$7,217.66	\$1,104.00	\$13,891.22	\$726.72	\$9,171.28
Sunburst Sportswear 95 N. Brandon Drive Glendale Heights, IL 60139	\$2,136.02	\$8,694.40	\$2,892.76	\$6,790.42	\$1,041.60	\$11,026.46	\$788.80	\$7,781.84
Wave Graphics 320 N. 2nd Street Mattoon, IL 61938	\$2,570.04	No Bid	No Bid	Non-Conforming Bid	\$1,425.60	\$15,975.83	No Bid	\$10,118.46